
 
 

FOR THE MEETING OF: May 16, 2019 

AGENDA ITEM:    6.a                           
 

TO: 
 

THROUGH: 

Historic Landmarks Commission  

 

Lisa Anderson-Ogilvie, AICP, Deputy Community 

Development Director and Planning Administrator 

FROM: Kimberli Fitzgerald, AICP, Historic Preservation Officer 

HEARING DATE: May 16, 2019 

CASE NO.: Historic Design Review Case No. HIS19-15 

APPLICATION 

SUMMARY: 

A proposal to remove the non-historic awnings and modify 

the storefront on the exterior of the Reed Opera House 

(1869). 

LOCATION: 189 Liberty Street NE 

REQUEST Major Historic Design Review of a proposal to remove 

the non-historic awnings, modify the storefront, and 

replace doors on the exterior of the Reed Opera House 

(1869), a Historic Contributing Resource within Salem's 

Downtown National Register Historic District, located at 

189 Liberty Street NE(Marion County Tax Assessor 

Number 073W27AB05900). 

APPLICANT(S): Donald Bauhofer for CH Reed, LLC 

APPROVAL CRITERIA: Salem Revised Code (SRC) Chapter 230  

230.040 Standards for Historic Contributing Buildings in 

Commercial Historic Districts (d) Storefronts 
 

 

RECOMMENDATION: APPROVE  
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BACKGROUND 

 
On April 4, 2019, the applicant submitted materials for a Major Historic Design Review 
for removing the non-historic awnings and modifying the storefront on the exterior of the 
Reed Opera House (1869). The application was deemed complete for processing on 
April 23, 2019.  
 
Notice of public hearing was sent by mail to surrounding property owners pursuant to 

Salem Revised Code (SRC) requirements on April 25, 2019 (Attachment A). Public 
hearing notice was also posted on the property in accordance with the posting provision 
outlined in SRC 300.620. 

 
The City of Salem Historic Landmarks Commission will hold a public hearing for the 
case on May 16, 2019 at 5:30 p.m., in Council Chambers, Room 240, located at 555 
Liberty Street SE.  

 
The state-mandated 120-day deadline to issue a final local decision, including any local 
appeals in this case is August 21, 2019, unless an extension is granted by the 
applicant. 

 

PROPOSAL 

 
The applicant, is proposing to remove all of the non-original awnings, and remove and 
relocate an existing entrance approximately 16’ to the east, requiring replacement and 
extension of the storefront on the western end of the Reed’s northern façade. 
Additionally, the applicant is proposing to replace non-original entry doors on the north, 

east, and western facades of the Reed (Attachment C). 

 

SUMMARY OF RECORD 

 
The following items are submitted to the record and are available upon request: All 
materials submitted by the applicant and any materials and comments from public 
agencies, City departments, neighborhood associations, and the public; and all 
documents referenced in this report. 
 

APPLICANT’S STATEMENT 
 
A request for historic design review must be supported by proof that it conforms to all 
applicable criteria imposed by the Salem Revised Code. The applicants submitted a 
written statement, which is included in its entirety as Attachment C in this staff report.  
 
Staff utilized the information from the applicant’s statements to evaluate the applicant’s 
proposal and to compose the facts and findings within the staff report. Salem Revised  

Code (SRC) 230.040Standards for Historic Contributing Buildings in Commercial 
Historic Districts (d) Storefronts are the applicable criteria for evaluation of this 
proposal.  
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FACTS & FINDINGS 
 

1. Historic Designation  
 
Under Salem Revised Code (SRC) Chapter 230, no development permit for a 
designated historic resource shall be issued without the approval of the Historic 
Landmarks Commission (HLC). The HLC shall approve, conditionally approve, or deny 
the application on the basis of the projects conformity with the criteria. Conditions of 
approval, if any, shall be limited to project modifications required to meet the applicable 
criteria.   
 
According to SRC 230.020(f), historic design review approval shall be granted if the 
application satisfies the applicable standards set forth in Chapter 230. The HLC shall 
render its decision supported by findings that explain conformance or lack thereof with 
relevant design standards, state the facts relied upon in rendering the decision, and 
explain justification for the decision. 
 

2. Historic Significance 

 
According to nomination documents the Reed Opera House was constructed in 1869 
by architect G.W. Rhodes as envisioned by Cyrus Adams Reed. Reed was a member 
of the Oregon State legislature. Originally, the building was constructed with a 1500 
seat Opera House on the second and third floors, there was a hotel on the western 
portion of the building. The building was also designed with space for the Oregon 
Supreme Court and the State Library and retail stores on the first floors. Reed was 
closely tied to the the Oregon Woman’s Suffrage Association, and Susan B. Anthony 
used the Reed stage in 1871 to campaign for votes for women.  
 
This resource is historic contributing to Salem’s Downtown Commercial Historic District. 
While the first floor storefront has been altered, overall it retains a high degree of 
integrity. The most significant alterations to the resource were in 1920. At this time, the 
first floor of the Reed Opera House was converted for use by Miller’s Department Store 
which remained in this building through the 1960s. The masonry first story, which 
originally reflected the design of the upper stories was replaced with a wood and glass 
storefront. The original triangular pediment on the roof of the eastern façade was also 
removed during this period. The 2nd and 3rd floors retain the integrity of their original 
design and openings. In 1994, the existing awnings were added to the exterior of the 
building as part of renovations for new tenants. In 2004, a triangular pediment was 
added back to the roof, restoring the appearance of this portion of the facade 

(Attachment B). 
 

3. Neighborhood and Citizen Comments 

 
The subject property is located within the Central Area Downtown Neighborhood 
Association (CANDO). Notification of the public hearing was sent to the neighborhood 
association, all property owners within the Salem Downtown National Register District, 
and surrounding property owners within 250 feet of the property pursuant to Salem 
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Revised Code (SRC) requirements on April 25, 2019. Notice of public hearing was also 
posted on the subject property. At the time of writing this staff report, no comments 
were received from the neighborhood association or from adjoining property owners. 
 

4. City Department and Public Agency Comments 
 
The Building and Safety Division indicates that the applicant must obtain required 
building permits.  
 

5. Historic Design Review 
 

SRC Chapter 230.040 specifies the standards applicable to this project. The applicant, 
is proposing to remove all of the non-original awnings, and remove and relocate an 
existing entrance approximately 16’ to the east, requiring replacement of the storefront 
on the western end of the Reed’s northern façade. Additionally, the applicant is 
proposing to replace non-original entry doors on the northern, eastern, and western 
facades of the Reed Opera House (Attachment C). Historic Landmarks Commission 
staff reviewed the project proposal and has the following findings for the applicable 
guidelines.   
 

FINDINGS 

 

Criteria 230.040 Standards for Historic Contributing Buildings in Commercial 

Historic Districts. 
 
(d)Storefronts. Replacement of storefronts or components of storefronts in historic 
contributing buildings shall be allowed only where the owner has attempted repair, but  
repair was determined to be unfeasible due to poor condition of the materials. If the 
storefront is not original then every effort shall be made to replicate the original 
feature; the effort shall be substantiated by historic, physical, or pictorial evidence. If 
the feature cannot be replicated then it should be of a compatible design and 
material. 

(1)  Materials.   
(A)  Original material shall, if possible, be retained or repaired. 
 

Finding: The awnings, storefront, and the doors proposed for replacement and 
relocation are not original to the structure. Therefore, staff recommends that the HLC 
find that there are no historic materials or features proposed for removal, 
reconstruction, or repair and that Standard 230.040 (d)(1)(A) is not applicable to the 
evaluation of this proposal.  
 

(B)  Replacement materials shall be, to the greatest extent practicable, of the same 
type, quality, design, size, finish, proportions, and configuration of the original 
materials in the storefront. 
 

Finding: The original storefront and door material is no longer extant; however, there is 
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photographic evidence of the original doors and storefront(s) which changed and 
evolved significantly from 1869 through the end of the period of significance for the 
Downtown Historic District (through 1950). It is likely that the original doors were wood 
and that throughout the many storefront changes the storefront material was wood or 
metal and trimmed with wood. The applicant is proposing to install a new storefront 
replicating the material of the existing with glass and wood and a painted stucco over 
concrete base, which when painted will have the same appearance as existing 
storefront throughout the first floor of the Reed. The non-original doors will be replaced 
with a wood, metal and glass door, painted to patch the building. Overall the proposed 
replacement materials are compatible, and of the same quality and type of materials 
currently found on the exterior of the Reed, therefore, staff recommends that the HLC 
find that SRC 230.040 (d)(1)(B) has been met for this proposal.   
 

(2)  Design.   
(A)  To the extent practicable, original storefront components such as windows, door 
configuration, transoms, signage, and decorative features shall be preserved. 
 

Finding: The original storefront is no longer extant, therefore it is not feasible to 
preserve character defining features of the original storefront. However, the existing 
awnings are not original to the structure, and the awning system that stretches along 
the northern and eastern facades of the structure currently blocks character defining 
features of the Reed, such as the transoms, which were added during the period of 
significance. The proposed door replacements on the east and western facades will be 
installed within the existing door openings which will be preserved, and no original 
character defining features will be adversely effected by their replacement or the 
replacement of the non-original storefront. Overall, the applicant’s proposal will serve to 
restore the exterior of the Reed, therefore, staff recommends that the HLC find that 
SRC 230.040(d)(2)(A) has been met.  
 
(B)  Where the original storefront is too deteriorated to save, the commercial 
character of the building shall be retained through: 
 
(i) A restoration of the storefront based on historical research and physical evidence.  

 

Finding: While there are historic photographs of the resource, the applicant is not 
proposing to restore the storefront to a precise date within the period of significance, 
therefore staff recommends that the HLC find that SRC 230.040(d)(2)(B)(i) does not 
apply to the evaluation of this proposal. 

 

(ii) Contemporary design that is compatible with the scale, design, materials, color 
and texture of historic compatible buildings in the district. 

 

Finding: The applicant is proposing to remove non-original awnings, replace non-
original doors, relocate an existing entry, and replace the storefront along the western 
portion of the north façade. This new storefront will replicate the material and design of 
the existing storefront with glass and wood and a painted stucco over concrete base, 
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which when painted will have the same appearance as existing storefront throughout 
the first floor of the Reed. Overall, the proposed alterations are compatible with the 
scale, design, and materials of the Reed, therefore staff recommends that the HLC 
find that SRC 230.040(d)(2)(B)(ii) has been met for this proposal. 

 

(C)  For buildings that provide a separate upper-story entrance on the exterior facade, 
the street-level entrance should be the primary focus of the building facade . 
 

Finding: While the applicant is proposing to replace the non-original doors, they are not 
proposing to alter the existing upper story entrance at the center of the northern façade. 
Removal of the non-original awnings and associated signage will ensure that the 
character defining features of this façade, such as this entry, can be better appreciated. 
Staff recommends that the HLC find that SRC 230.040(d)(2)(C) has been met.  
 

(D)  Original openings that have been covered or blocked should be re-opened when 
feasible. 
 

Finding: While the storefront has been altered multiple times since its construction, the 
most significant alterations were in 1920. During this period the masonry first story 
which originally reflected the design of the upper stories was replaced with a wood and 
glass storefront. At this time no openings were filled in, but instead this first floor was 
opened up. The 2nd and 3rd floors retain the integrity of their original design and 
openings, and none have been filled in. Since there are no openings that have been 
filled in within the areas proposed for replacement, staff recommends that the HLC find 
that SRC 230.040(d)(2)(D) is not applicable to the evaluation of this proposal.  
 
 

RECOMMENDATION 
 
Based upon the information presented in the application, plans submitted for review, 
and findings as presented in this staff report, staff recommends that the Historic 

Landmarks Commission APPROVE the proposal. 

  

DECISION ALTERNATIVES 
 
1.  APPROVE the proposal as submitted by the applicant and indicated on the               
     drawings. 
 
2.  APPROVE the proposal with conditions to satisfy specific guideline(s). 
 
3.  DENY the proposal based on noncompliance with identified guidelines in SRC 230,  
     indicating which guideline(s) is not met and the reason(s) the guideline is not met.   
 
Attachments: A.  Hearing Notice and Vicinity Map 
 B. Excerpt from National Register Historic Resource Document 
 C. Applicant’s Submittal Materials 
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Prepared by Kimberli Fitzgerald, AICP, Historic Preservation Officer  
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HEARING NOTICE 
LAND USE REQUEST AFFECTING THIS AREA 

 

Audiencia Pública 

Si necesita ayuda para comprender esta informacion, por favor llame 503-588-6173 

 
CASE NUMBER: Historic Design Review Case No. HIS19-15 

AMANDA APPLICATION NO: 19-108632-DR 

HEARING INFORMATION: 

 

Historic Landmarks Commission, Thursday, May 16, 2019, 5:30 P.M., Council 
Chambers, Room 240, Civic Center, 555 Liberty Street SE, Salem, OR 97301 
 

PROPERTY LOCATION: 189 Liberty St NE, Salem OR 97301 

OWNER(S): CH Reed, LLC (Graham Chernoff and Scott Chernoff) 

APPLICANT / AGENT(S): Donald N. Bauhofer 

DESCRIPTION OF 

REQUEST: 

SUMMARY: A proposal to remove the non-historic awnings and modify the storefront on 
the exterior of the Reed Opera House (1869). 

 
REQUEST: Major Historic Design Review of a proposal to remove the non-historic 
awnings, modify the storefront, and replace doors on the exterior of the Reed Opera 
House (1869), a Historic Contributing Resource within Salem's Downtown National 
Register Historic District, located at 189 Liberty Street NE(Marion County Tax Assessor 
Number 073W27AB05900). 
 

CRITERIA TO BE 

CONSIDERED: 

Salem Revised Code (SRC) Chapter 230.040 - Standards for historic contributing 

buildings in commercial historic districts.  

(d)  Storefronts.  Replacement of storefronts or components of storefronts in historic 
contributing buildings shall be allowed only where the owner has attempted repair, but 
repair was determined to be unfeasible due to poor condition of the materials. If the 
storefront is not original then every effort shall be made to replicate the original feature; 
the effort shall be substantiated by historic, physical, or pictorial evidence. If the feature 
cannot be replicated then it should be of a compatible design and material. 

(1) Materials. 

     (A)  Original material shall, if possible, be retained or repaired. 

     (B)  Replacement materials shall be, to the greatest extent practicable, of the same 
type, quality, design, size, finish, proportions, and configuration of the original 
materials in the storefront. 

(2)  Design. 

      (A)  To the extent practicable, original storefront components such as windows, 
door configuration, transoms, signage, and decorative features shall be 
preserved. 

      (B)  Where the original storefront is too deteriorated to save, the commercial 
character of the building shall be retained through: 

             (i)  A restoration of the storefront based on historical research and physical 
evidence. 

             (ii)  Contemporary design that is compatible with the scale, design, materials, 
color and texture of historic compatible buildings in the district. 

       (C)  For buildings that provide a separate upper-story entrance on the exterior 
façade, the street-level entrance should be the primary focus of the building 
façade. 
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HOW TO PROVIDE 

TESTIMONY: 

 

Any person wishing to speak either for or against the proposed request may do so in 
person or by representative at the Public Hearing.  Written comments may also be 
submitted at the Public Hearing.  Include case number with the written comments.  
Prior to the Public Hearing, written comments may be filed with the Salem Planning 
Division, Community Development Department, 555 Liberty Street SE, Room 305, 
Salem, Oregon 97301.  Only those participating at the hearing, in person or by 
submission of written testimony, have the right to appeal the decision. 

HEARING PROCEDURE: 

The hearing will be conducted with the staff presentation first, followed by the 
applicant’s case, neighborhood organization comments, testimony of persons in favor 
or opposition, and rebuttal by the applicant, if necessary.  The applicant has the burden 
of proof to show that the approval criteria can be satisfied by the facts.  Opponents may 
rebut the applicant’s testimony by showing alternative facts or by showing that the 
evidence submitted does not satisfy the approval criteria. Any participant may request 
an opportunity to present additional evidence or testimony regarding the application.  A 
ruling will then be made to either continue the Public Hearing to another date or leave 
the record open to receive additional written testimony.   
 
Failure to raise an issue in person or by letter prior to the close of the Public Hearing 
with sufficient specificity to provide the opportunity to respond to the issue, precludes 
appeal to the Land Use Board of Appeals (LUBA) on this issue.  A similar failure to 
raise constitutional issues relating to proposed conditions of approval precludes an 
action for damages in circuit court.  
 
Following the close of the Public Hearing a decision will be issued and mailed to the 
applicant, property owner, affected neighborhood association, anyone who participated 
in the hearing, either in person or in writing, and anyone who requested to receive 
notice of the decision. 

CASE MANAGER: 
 

Kimberli Fitzgerald, Historic Preservation Officer, City of Salem Planning Division, 
555 Liberty Street SE, Room 305, Salem, Oregon 97301. Telephone: 503-540-2397; E-
mail: kfitzgerald@cityofsalem.net.  
 

NEIGHBORHOOD 

ORGANIZATION: 

 

Central Area Neighborhood Development Organization (CAN-DO), Bruce Hoffman, 
Land Use Chair; Phone: 503-781-8542; Email: bruhof@gmail.com.   

DOCUMENTATION 

AND STAFF REPORT: 

Copies of the application, all documents and evidence submitted by the applicant are 
available for inspection at no cost at the Planning Division office, City Hall, 555 Liberty 
Street SE, Room 305, during regular business hours.  Copies can be obtained at a 
reasonable cost.  The Staff Report will be available seven (7) days prior to the hearing, 
and will thereafter be posted on the Community Development website: 
 
https://www.cityofsalem.net/Pages/planning-notices-decisions.aspx 
 

ACCESS: The Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) accommodations will be provided on 
request. 
 

NOTICE MAILING DATE: April 25, 2019 

 

PLEASE PROMPTLY FORWARD A COPY OF THIS NOTICE TO ANY OTHER OWNER, TENANT OR LESSEE. 
For more information about Planning in Salem: 

http://www.cityofsalem.net/planning 

It is the City of Salem’s policy to assure that no person shall be discriminated against on the grounds of race, religion, color, sex, marital 

status, familial status, national origin, age, mental or physical disability, sexual orientation, gender identity and source of income, as 

provided by Salem Revised Code Chapter 97. The City of Salem also fully complies with Title VI of the Civil Rights Act of 1964, and 

related statutes and regulations, in all programs and activities. Disability-related modification or accommodation, including auxiliary 

aids or services, in order to participate in this meeting or event, are available upon request. Sign language and interpreters for languages 

other than English are also available upon request. To request such an accommodation or interpretation, contact the Community 

Development Department at 503-588-6173 at least three business days before this meeting or event.  
TTD/TTY telephone 503-588-6439 is also available 24/7 

 

mailto:kfitzgerald@cityofsalem.net
mailto:bruhof@gmail.com
https://www.cityofsalem.net/Pages/planning-notices-decisions.aspx
http://www.cityofsalem.net/planning


Community Development Dept.

n

n

n

n

RA
ILW

AY

SA
NT

A F
E

BU
RL

ING
TO

N N
OR

TH
ER

N

OAK   STREET   SE

VA
CA

TE
D 

 CA
PIT

OL
  S

T  
SE

FERRY ST SE

BELLEVUE ST SE

OAK ST SE

CO
MM

ER
CIA

L S
T N

E

CO
MM

ER
CIA

L S
T S

E

LIB
ER

TY
 ST

 NE

LIB
ER

TY
 ST

 SE

HIG
H S

T S
E

HIG
H S

T N
E

WI
NT

ER
 ST

 SE

WI
NT

ER
 ST

 NE

CH
UR

CH
 ST

RE
ET

 NE

CO
TT

AG
E S

TR
EE

T N
E

CHEMEKETA ST NE
FR

ON
T S

T N
EWA

TE
R S

T N
E

CENTER ST NE

CO
MM

ER
CIA

L S
T N

E

LIB
ER

TY
 ST

 NE

HIG
H S

T N
E

CH
UR

CH
 ST

 NE

CO
TT

AG
E S

T N
E

MARION ST NE

UNION ST NE

WI
NT

ER
 NE

LIB
ER

TY
 ST

 SE

CO
MM

ER
CIA

L S
T S

E

HIG
H S

T S
E

BELLEVUE ST SE

MILL ST SE

TRADE ST SE

FERRY ST SE

CH
UR

CH
 ST

 SE

CO
TT

AG
E S

T S
E

PRINGLE PY SE
P RINGLE PY SE

BELLEVUE ST SE

STATE ST

COURT ST NE

COURT ST NE

MILL ST SE

RIVERFRONT PARK

CIVIC CENTER

WALLACE MARINE PARK MARION SQUARE PARK

MILL RACE BEAUTIFICATION

PRINGLE TRAIL

SALEM DOWNTOWN HISTORIC DISTRICT

GAIETY HILL/BUSH'S PASTURE PARK HISTORIC DISTRICT

ST JOSEPH CATHOLIC SCHOOL
SCHOOL

ROBERTS HIGH SCHOOL DOWNTOWN LEARNING CENTER
SCHOOL

Vicinity Map
189 Liberty Street  NE

Ê0 200 400100 Feet

Subject Property

Wi
lla

me
tte

 R
ive

r

Willamette River

j

13
TH

  S
T

17
TH

  S
T

HI
GH

  S
T

Mc GILCHRIST

MARKET  ST

FAIRVIEW

MISSION

CA
PIT

OL

PINE

FAIRGROUNDS

25
TH

RURAL AVE
ST

RD

ST

STSTATE    ST

CENTER   ST

GLEN  CREEK  RD

FR
ON

T  
ST

CENTER  ST

SILVERTON

MARION

BR
OA

DW
AY

HOYT

CO
MM

ER
CI

AL
  S

T

ST

ST

SUNNYVIEW

12
TH

  S
T

TURNER  RD

WALLACE   RD

ST

Parks
n Schools

Inset Map

Legend
Outside Salem City Limits
Urban Growth Boundary
Taxlots

G:\CD\PLANNING\LisaAnderson\Fairview\189 Liberty St NE.mxd - 5/10/2010 @ 2:57:27 PM

This product is provided as is, without warranty.  In no
event is the City of Salem liable for damages from the
use of this product.   This product is subject to license
and copyright limitations and further distribution or
resale is prohibited.

Historic District



Reed Opera House 189 Liberty St NE ATTACHMENT B 

 

 

 

Statesman Journal, July 13, 2004. Page 1 

 

 

 

 

 



Reed Opera House 189 Liberty St NE ATTACHMENT B 

 

Statesman Journal, June 10, 1994. Page 7. 

 



Reed Opera House 189 Liberty St NE ATTACHMENT B 

 

 

 

 

 

Reed Opera House. 1975-1980. Salem Public Library. Photo ID SCH203 
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Reed Opera House. 1965-1978. Dan Poush Photo, Statesman Journal. Photo ID SJ544 

 

 

Reed Opera House. 1970. Marion County Historical Society. Photo ID MJON0067 

 

 



Reed Opera House 189 Liberty St NE ATTACHMENT B 

 

Reed – Miller’s Dept Store- looking southeast along Court Street. 10-23-1961, Ben Maxwell Collection. 

Salem Public Library. Photo ID 1437 



Reed Opera House 189 Liberty St NE ATTACHMENT B 

 

Reed, 1939   Ben Maxwell Collection, Salem Public Library  Photo ID 1420 

 

 

 



Reed Opera House 189 Liberty St NE ATTACHMENT B 

 

Reed Opera House and Miller’s Department Store, circa 1920.   Marion County Historical Society – 

EE37EF6B/ Salem photo ID MJON0265 

 

Reed Opera House. 1893.  Marion County Historical Society. Photo ID MJON0224. 



Reed Opera House 189 Liberty St NE ATTACHMENT B 

 

Reed Opera House, 1880     Marion County Historical Society. EBAA821B/ Salem ID MJON0069 
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